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The publication Tai Chi Chuan & Internal Arts has 
been the voice of the Tai Chi and Qigong Union for 
Great Britain for over 30 years.  From the beginning 
the object of the journal has been to inform members 
of developments in the arts and allow them to share 
ideas and opinions. 

In 2021 the magazine was redesigned and put online 
but at the end of 2022 the magazine returned to print.  
The print edition goes out to around 1,000 members, 
three times a year and is popular with the 
membership.  When it was online, magazine 
attracted a high readership with over 1,000 unique 
visitors each month since its launch.  The flip version 
received around 1,700 views with visitors opening 
3,000+ pages. 

The editorial team welcome contributions from 
members (though we do not guarantee publication) 
and our regular profile section Meet the Teacher 
gives members the opportunity to tell us about their 
background in Tai Chi, Qigong and other Internal 
Arts. 

There are also regular articles on health, aspects of 
Tai Chi, Qigong and other Internal Arts. 

The editorial team will be happy to advise on length 
and format.  We also require hi-resolution pictures to 
accompany articles. 

 



 

 

Members of the Tai Chi and Qigong 
Union for Great Britain get a 30% 
discount on the Display Advertising 
Rates. 

Tai Chi Chuan & Internal Arts is published three times 
a year by the Tai Chi and Qigong Union which is a 
trading name for The Tai Chi Union for Great Britain 
C.I.C.  Registered in England & Wales. Registration 
number 11249130.  Registered office Solo House, 
The Courtyard, London Road, Horsham, W. Sussex, 
England, RH12 1AT 


